Purchasing Department

Madison County Board of Supervisors
146 West Center Street
Canton, Mississippi 39046

601-855-5503
hardy@madison-co.com

2 March 2016

District 1 Supervisor Sheila Jones
District 2 Supervisor Trey Baxter
District 3 Supervisor Gerald Steen
District 4 Supervisor David Bishop
District 5 Supervisor Paul Griffin

Subject: Award Asphalt Term Bids for Period 1 April 2016 — 30 September 2016

Dear Board Members:

Attached is a bid tabulation and copies of recently-opened term bids for asphalt products
and services for the six-month period 1 April 2016 — 30 September 2016.

A few bits of good news:

The SC 1 Type II surface asphalt price decreased $4 per ton, from $55 to $51.
The price of liquid asphalt decreased 38 cents per gallon, from $2.06 to $1.68.

I recommend that the Board take the following action:

L.

Award the Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2016
—30 Sept 2016 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton’s price for SC-1 of $51 is higher than APAC-Jackson’s
bid; however, the round-trip haul distance from APAC-Jackson’s plants is
much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-
truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a
ton of SC 1 Type II Asphalt from APAC-Canton is $51.23 compared to
$52.39 from the next lowest bidder, APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton
the “lowest and best bid.” The cost per ton picked up is even greater from
D&B and ADCAMP. Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as
part of this letter by reference.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to APAC-Jackson.

Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to D&B.



10.

I,

12

13.

14.

Award the Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2016
—30 Sept 2016 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton’s bid for SC-1 Type II of $56 is higher than APAC-
Jackson’s bid of $54; however, the round-trip haul distance to APAC-Jackson
is much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-
truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a
ton of SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is $56.23 compared to $58.39
from APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the “lowest and best bid.” The
cost per ton picked up is even greater from D&B and ADCAMP. Detailed
calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to APAC-Jackson.

Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type 8 ASPHALT for the
period 1 April 2016 —30 Sept 2016 to D&B. D&B’s and ADCAMP’s bids are
the same; however, the slightly shorter haul distance to D&B makes it the
“lowest and best” second alternate bid.

Award the Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2016 — 30
Sept 2016 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton’s bid for BB-1 Asphalt of $46 is equal to APAC-
Jackson’s bid; however, the round-trip haul distance to APAC-Jackson’s plant
is much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-
truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a
ton of BB-1 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is $46.23 compared to $50.39 from
APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the “lowest and best bid.” Detailed
calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1
April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to APAC-Jackson.

Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1
April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to Dickerson & Bowen.

Award the Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2016 — 30
Sept 2016 to ERGON.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1
April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to Blackledge.

Award the Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept
2016 to Dickerson & Bowen.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April
2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to APAC-Jackson.

Award the Term Bid for ROAD RECLAMATION for the period 1 April 2016
—30 Sept 2016 to ADCAMP.



15, Award the Term Bid for ROAD BASE REPAIRS (10-Inch Depth) for the
period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to APAC-Canton.

16.  Award the First Alternate Term Bid for ROAD BASE REPAIRS (10 Inch
Depth) for the period 1 April 2016 —30 Sept 2016 to ADCAMP.

17. Award the Term Bid for ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11-24 Inch Depth) for the
period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to ADCAMP.

18. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11-24 Inch
Depth) for the period 1 April 2016 —30 Sept 2016 to D&B.

19. Award the Term Bid for COLD MILLING for the period 1 April 2016 - 30
Sept 2016 to D&B.

20.  Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MILLING for the period 1
April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to ADCAMP.

21. Award the Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT for the period
1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to ADCAMP.

22, Award the First Alternate Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING
ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 to APAC-Canton.

23.  Reject Dickerson & Bowen’s bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT
for the period 1 April 2016 — 30 Sept 2016 due to the company’s failure to
meet the specifications. The company did not bid on hauling and laying
asphalt from the county’s selected asphalt vendor as required by the
specifications.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations.

Sincerely,

7.

Hardy £runk
Purclfase Clerk



ASPHALT TABULATION FOR 1 APRIL 2016 30 SEPT 2016

Terry May Terry May Don Gleen Ralph Barnes C Vowell
0:376-4000  O: 376-4000  O: 346-7368 O: 939-4493 O: 797-4554
F: 376-4055  F: 376-4055 F: 346-71562  C: 940-1343 C: 517-0337
john.may@apac.com dongleen@ ralph@ cvowell@
bellsouth.net adcampinc.com blain-co.com
SC 1 TYPE Il PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT ~ Dickerson ADCAMP  BLAIN
| kson Rankin Mt Olive
Miles to Road Department , A 28 40
SC 1 Type Il Asphalt ‘ 48.00 2 $53.00 $53.00
Round Trip Miles 3 56.4 47.6 56 80
X $1.09 Per Mile Freight Cost $3.27 $61.48 $51.88 $61.04 $87.20
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up $0.23 $4.39 $3.71 $4.36 $6.23
Cost per ton picked-up $51.23 $52.39 $55.71 $57.36 $59.23
SC 1 TYPE 8 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT ADCAMP BLAIN
Rankin Mt Olive
Miles to Road Department 28 40
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt , ; $55.00 $56.00
Round Trip Miles 3 56.4 49.8 56 80
X $1.09 Per Mile Freight Cost $3.27 $61.48 $54.28 $61.04 $87.20
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up $0.23 $4.39 $3.88 $4.36 $6.23
Cost per ton picked-up $56.23 $58.39 $58.88 $59.36 $62.23
BB 1 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT ADCAMP BLAIN
Rankin Mt Olive
Miles to Road Department ’ 28 40
BB 1 ASPHALT ~ $48.00 $50.00 $49.00
Round Trip Miles 3 56.4 47.6 56 80
X $1.09 Per Mile Freight Cost $3.27 $61.48 $51.88 $61.04 $87.20
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up $0.23 $4.39 $3.71 $4.36 $6.23
Cost per ton picked-up $46.23 $50.39 $51.71 $54.36 $55.23



HAULING & LAYING ASPHALT HANCOCK

662-209-3278

APAC Dickerson
JACKSON Jackson

REJECT
LAYING $17.50
HAULING $0.20
BIDDER'S ASP
ONLY
COLD MIX

LIQUID ASPHALT
CRS-2

ROAD RECLAMATION
4 Inches
8 Inches
12 Inches
18 Inches
24 Inches

APAC CANTON  APAC JAX DICKERSON ADCAMP
ROAD BASE REPAIRS (10 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD $66.00 $183.00 $70.00

ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11-24 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD $200.00 $165.00

APAC CANTON  APAC JAX
COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) PER SQ YD - $4.85
500 sq yd min




ESTIMATE OF COSTS PER MILE TO OPERATE DUMP TRUCKS
FOR THE PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 - 30 SEPT 2016

AVERAGE MPG FOR DUMP TRUCK 5.34
DIESEL PRICE PER GALLON $1.13
DIESEL COST PER MILE $0.21
OTHER COSTS PER MILE (TIRES, REPAIRS, ETC) $0.18
TOTAL TRUCK COST PER MILE $0.39
AVERAGE DRIVER WAGES & BENEFITS $20.88
AVERAGE MILES DRIVEN PER HOUR 30
DRIVER COST PER MILE $0.70
TOTAL COST PER MILE $1.09

Notes: Diesel price is based upon most recent Fuelman bill
Driver wages and benefits based upon cost figures from Human Resources Director
"Other Costs" is based upon purchase orders issued for tires, repairs, parts, etc.

HARDY CRUNK, PURCHASE CLERK



B Fuelman

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # BG125940
FLEET # 123738
Name: MADISON CO BOARD OF SUPERVISOR
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP46719641
Page: 19 of 31

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 123738 — MADISON CO BOARD OF SUPERVISOR; 2/15/2016 — 2/21/2016

Department: 300

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL _NET TOTAL  EXCEPT

DATE TIME SITE __ DRIVER ODOMETER __MPG___ TYPE QTyY PRICE _ TAXES AMT CODE*
10465 — 2014 DODGE RAM L & U 2
0216 06:35 410036 JOHNSON,G 32863 105  UNL 10007 1.15020 0.13290 %1284
02/17 06:36 410036 JOHNSON, G 32977 114 UNL 10.043  1.15020  0.13290 $12.89
02/18 08:38 865017 JOHNSON, G 33054 9.7 UNL 7.899  1.15020  0.13290 $10.15

Miles: 296 105 27.949 $35.88
1189066 — 05 CHEVY TAHOE oy RSl VR SN Y
0219 1617 904271  shirly 152196 203 UNL 13.380  1.15020  0.13290  $17.17

Miles: 271 203 13.380 $17.17
'21578 — 2016 MACK TRACTOR TRUCK ' L o IR
02116 14:32 865017 JACKSONM 14130 43 UDSL*  86.202 ' 013940 _ $122.30

Miles: 368 43" 86.202 $122.30
121587 — 2016 MACK TRACTOR TRUCK _ 3
02/19 14:53 865017 BROOKS, LO 30218 5.0 UDSL* 73534 1.27940  0.13940  $104.32

Miles: 371 5.0 - 73.534 $104.32
121588 — 2016 MACK TRACTOR TRUCK ' '
02/18 13:39 865017 JOHNCROSS 28280 46  UDSL* 79470 1.27940 0.13940  $112.33

Miles: 368 4.6 79.170 $112.33
21589 — 2016 MACK TRACTOR TRUCK _ ; : ; 2
02/18 08:22 865017 cynjanvis o 27866 59 , UDSL* _ 80.878 1.27940  0.13940 _ $114.75

Miles: 476 59 80.878 $114.75
21591 — 2016 MACK TRACTOR TRUCK !
02/18 1422 865017 RICKY SLAU 27012 49 , UDSL* 40482 1.27940  0.13940 $57.43

Miles 200 49 40.482 $57.43
2301 - 2015 MACK S s A . e e o
0216 14146 865017 LOVE,ROBI 45065 3.7 UDSL* 35594 1.27940 0.13940  $50.51
02/19 13:50 865017 LOVE, ROBI 45226 39. UDSL* 41.658  1.27940  0.13940 $59.11

Miles: 204 38 77.252 $109.62
12302 — 2015 MACK ,
02/19 1049 865017 JACKSON M 45702 44 _ UDSL* 53874 1.27940 0.13940  $76.44

Miles: 237 44 53.874 $76.44
(2304 — 2015 MACK ‘
02117 1425 865017 VANBUREN, 45512 40  UDSL*  33.868 1.27940 0.13940  $4805
02119 13:55 865017 VANBUREN, 45636 4.6 UDSL* 26.936  1.27940  0.13940 $38.22

Miles: 258 4.3 60.804 $86.27
12305 - 2015 MACK : : . '
02118 1555 865017 LarryBur 48103 42 UDSL* 51.307 1.27940  0.13940  $72.80

Miles: 218 4.2 51.307 $72.80
12306 — 2015 MACK. . ,
02117 14:58 865017 BALDWIN,M 52261 33 UDSL* 46998 1.27940 0.13940  $66.69
02119 13:58 865017 BALDWIN, M 52723  17.0 “"UDSL* 27252 1.27940  0.13940 $38.67

Miles: 616  10.2 74.250 $105.36
TIOT L I MACK. - o L e s L LR L S - %, o 3
0219 11:54 865017 Zintros Bl 52246 52 UDSL* 57633 1.27940  0.13940  $81.78

Miles: 301 5.2 57.633 $81.78
N0R 2018 A T e W O S Sk Y
02/17 14:35 865017 AUSTINJ 63102 35  UDSL* 30.785 1.27940  0.13940 $43.68
02119 14:50 865017 AUSTINJ 63375 56 uDsL* 48744  1.27940  0.13940 $69.15

Miles: 380 4.6 79.529 $112.83
42894 - 2011 CHEVY CREWCABPLU 3, SRt
0216 0830 413714 BACONC 116512 12.9 UNL 23769 1.15020 0.13290  $3050

Miles: 306 129 23.769 $30.50




MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET -

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type 1I Asphalt | Dl i per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt 5(0°2 per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt 4{00/9 per ton
Cold Mix NA per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NA per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENgtkLD/Y\
— (

The oYouwe s, Fol BPAC's C\M\:\W({ PSR UO(au}c i N

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be

undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects

in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-

awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

b Py |
Hauling . " per ton-mile

Laying | A /! g per ton 3po T Mot

TD/




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth )\J Vk per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth NL\A/ per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth N tA’ per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth N A per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth N \A/ per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon /V 4
Per Linear Foot /V /4/
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

60
Per Square Yard & [a(o'i)o 923N %\é
!
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard %ﬁf N \A‘

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard 3‘549}? 500 %y V\A;\\M




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: | Be Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: AN~ )\)&ssxss‘\;\p\)\ e
apDRESs: (0. Pox Zp8

deon Mo 9225- 4508
TELEPHONE: €D\~ B3 1l-4800
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (00 \-954- 8 blo
FAXNUMBER: O\~ Z1\- 4085
EMAIL:__OW. Yhasy © Geac. Coun

/\Zj«,% 2- 1=\

ANTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE ~ DATE

/
[ERRY MHY
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC1 Type II Asphalt_ | 43 > per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt - 6/ = per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt ?/ é z per ton
Cold Mix (_79(/2 7 z per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NA per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENT. \\_:\
S «
/7

The doore malecta) 1S FolB APACS Qoo s plass

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be
undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects
in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-
awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

ge
Hauling jH %//5 /mmmir~ per ton-mile

Laying ’A//\l ~  perton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth /(Mr per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth N\A per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth NW vper square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth N i per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth _ N is per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR

(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon | N W
Per Linear Foot M \A/
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard N A

Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard N /4'

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard N A/




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 78.Z Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: 2 M/% éﬁ/fslépx L.
apDRESS: D). o X ZASDO8
Gceon, Mo F25-4508
TELEPHONE: o[- 3T\~ 400
CELL PHONE NUMBER: &9 [-QAA-57b(,
FAXNUMBER: (00 [~ &1lb- 4655
EMAIL: | DWA, Mo © (10&@ QO A
%/ ZA

AUTH019ZED RPZISRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

“JEARYMAY

PRINTED AUTH(JRIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET -

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET

CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt Bgpee per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt #5g, o2 per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt B4g.00 per ton
Cold Mix 955,09 per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered Mo B:d per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENT.

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be
undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects
in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-
awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

) _ Bidders Asplnlt pPlant
Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county-s-designated-asphatt-vender(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to &s—ehesen

asphalt-vendes(s). The Bidder
g _zo

Hauling O~ per ton-mile

Laying 7,740 per ton



ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth #o Badl per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth Wo Bicl per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth we Bid per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth we Bicl per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth. o B per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon ‘ Ao B-d
Per Linear Foot rb Bicl
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard 95,2

Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard $200°F

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard £




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the .
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 23.8 - Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:  Dickerso~ & Bowe v he,

ADDRESS: PO. Box jo0%

Broolkh pve u,lds. FReo

TELEPHONE: (cot) 9 -2002

CELL PHONE NUMBER: @eq:)S40-5005

FAX NUMBER: Gol) 96%-2004

BMAT:  aoaplosds bailseat, we i

/% 3/t/t¢

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

Do L. Cleww  dpven Mrvirt yor
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt 53. 06 per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt 55.00 per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt 50.00 per ton
Cold Mix NO BID per ton
-CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NO BID per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENT.

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be
undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects
in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-
awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling - 0.20 PER TON _per ton-mile
PER MILE - MINIMUM HAUL $3.00
Laying ' 11.19 per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth 30.00 per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth 35.00 per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth 40.00 per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth 45.00 per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth 55.00 per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon NO BID
Per Linear Foot NO BID
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard 70.00 -

Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard 165.00

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard 4.00




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 28 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: ADCAMP, INC.

PHYSICAL
ADDRESS: 1353 FLOWOOD DRIVE, FLOWOOD, MS 39232

MAILING
ADDRESS: P. O. BOX 54246, JACKSON, MS 39288-4246

TELEPHONE: ___ 601-939-2493

CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-940-1343

FAX NUMBER: 601-939-4676

EMAIL: ralph@adcampinc.com

%/L/y\& é‘w March 1, 2016
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

RALPH BARNES, PRESIDENT
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET -

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt -# 53.60 perton '
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt HA56.00 perton.
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt ~# 49. 00 per ton
Cold Mix Mo AD per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered Ao BrD  per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENT.

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be
undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects
in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-
awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and

hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling Ay D per ton-mile

Laying Mo @,b per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth Mo RD per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth Mo (3D per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth Ao B/D per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth Ao B per square yard

24 (twenty-four) inch depth Na g,p per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon V.04 @,“/)

Per Linear Foot y.148) '@/D

ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard _ A6 A0

Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard _ Ay AD

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard No A.D




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the,
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 4o Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:___({/. . Bh,‘u;f/ Sons ,THC.
ADDRESS: P o). Pay ROT

Mt lrve Mz 39119
TELEPHONE: ___ 60(- 797-4/55 ]

CELL PHONE NUMBER: _ &0[- 5/7- 0337

FAXNUMBER: 601- 297- 4727

EMAIL: _ Ctg u/el/(a) b/ac‘/v—ca . o

/ﬂ( N— 3-/-1&

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

54/%'/\/ % we | (

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



|

MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt NO BID per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt NO BID per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt NO BID per ton
Cold Mix NO BID per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered : $1.68 per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENT.

Pricing based on delivery of full truck transport quantities.

Hauling and Laying Aspha]t Demurrage: 2 hours free; $75/hr thereafter.
Federal Environmental Fee: $0.00133/gal.

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be
undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects
in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-
awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and

hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling N/A -pcr ton-mile

Laying N/A per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth N/A per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth N/A per square yard
12 (twelvé) inch depth N/A per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth N/A per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth N/A per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear F oot)

Per Gallon | N/A
Per Linear Foot N/A
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard N/A

Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard N/A

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard N/A




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: _approximately 65 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

ADDRESS: P. O. Box 23028

Jackson, MS 39225-3028

TELEPHONE: (601) 933-3000

CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601)497-7278

FAX NUMBER: (601) 933-3363

EMAIL: Amy.Walker@ergon.com
Ao S Log s vrch 1,201
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

Amy L. Walker, Area Sales Manager

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



™ Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc. t. 800-866-3878
12251 Bernard Parkway
Suite 200

Guifpert, MS 39503

February 24, 2016

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Madison County Chancery Courthouse
Rooms 225-227, Second Floor

146 West Center Street

Canton, MS 39046

RE: Asphalt Bid
To Whom It May Concern,

Please find enclosed the bid for liquid asphalt from Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc. Above bid is
due to open on March 1, 2016.

Let us know if we need to provide you with any other documentation. We look forward to
working with you in the future.

Thank you,

e Wef

JR Wood

Area Sales Manager
Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.
228-863-3878 (0)
228-864-0437 (F)
601-209-4374 (C)
jrwood@be-inc.com

Enclosures



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2016 — 30 SEPTEMBER 2016

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 1 MARCH 2016

‘MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt | ~ per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt / per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt 7 per ton
Cold Mix - per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered &b |. ¢ per gallon

NOTE: ALL FEDERAL TAXES MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. BID PRICE
LIMITED TO DOLLARS AND CENTS ONLY. NO FRACTIONS OF A CENT.

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid “Hauling & Laying of Asphalt” is for selected road projects to be
undertaken by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects
in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-
awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and

hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

‘Hauling el per ton-mile

Laying P per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth -~ per square yard

8 (eight) inch depth ol . per square yard

12 (twelve) inch depth -~ per square yard

18 (eighteen) inch depth i per square yard
7

24 (twenty-four) inch depth per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon -~

Per Linear Foot 7~
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard -~

Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard s

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard il




For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 2|2 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: @V\#\'\Ao)t Emnleions, (ne.
ADDRESS: 1216|  Bey wwd Towlwmn oudz 200
Gulbgort , M Zcoz )

TELEPHONE: __ 228.8l%. 5619

CELL PHONE NUMBER: (40| - 2.09. 42714

FAX NUMBER: 229-8L4.0427]

EMAIL: \¥ woocl @ be - inc.comt

(}1:) W o | 2boal

AU@AORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

J.R. Wood
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



